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In the late 1960s it was my good fortune to participate in an endeavor 
called "The History Education Project." It was an effort to provide sum- 
mer seminars at Yale for New Haven secondary school teachers of history 
who wanted an opportunity to update their knowledge of their given fields 
of history. In most cases that meant American history and so many of my 
colleagues in the field offered seminars. 

Those were troubling if exciting days for history as a discipline was 
under attack for not being relevant, for being boring, for covering too long 
a period in its traditional survey form, and for failing to keep the attention 
span of the most conscientious student, not to speak of the least attentive 
one. Meanwhile history itself was being joined or rather submerged in the 
social sciences, or civics, or social problems courses. I remember my 
daughter having one that focused on Vietnam, Venereal Disease, Alco- 
holism, and Eskimos. 

In the various History Education Project seminars, whether they were 
on the Jacksonian Period or the Civil War, or Recent Trends in American 
Historiography, I found that both the high school teachers and the uni- 
versity instructors were faced with the reality that constitutional issues or 
military battles no longer seemed as real as the past of the Black Ameri- 
can, or heroes who could be understood by Americans of all ethnic back- 
grounds. It was clear that both the shape and content of history and even 
the approach to history had to change. All of us faced a common disci- 
plinary and instructional crisis which, I am delighted to say, laid to rest 
the myth that in a dialogue between college professors and public school 
teachers, each could understand the other's language but in effect refused 
to speak it. We soon discovered that we had common problems and 
interests and that, indeed, history was an ideal subject for seminars 
devoted to catching up in one's field with the new research, learning to 
























